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At a special meeting of the Board of Commissioners of the Clty of Filkeville,
Kentucky held in the City Hall on March 22, 1965 at 7:30 P.M., the following
members of the Board were present:

Mayor: W. C. Hambley, M.D.
Commlissioners: F, W. Baker

Harry Hobson

Uhlan Taylor

Also present were the City Manager, W. E. Butcher, City Rttmrne?, 04 Es
Hinton, and the members of the Pikeville Independent Board of Educatlon and
Architect Jack T. Hatcher,

Mayor Hambley stated that the purpose of the meeting was to open and
consider sealed bids for construction and equipment on the hew e}ementary
school building to be constructed. Thereupon the Mayor opened the blds which
were read in their entirety and appended to and made a part of these minutes.,

Chairman of the Schocl Board, Wajter Wells requested that the School Board
be given until Friday &april 2, 19%5 to study and consider the bids.

F. W, Baker moved that Mr. Wells request be granted. Harry Hobscn seconded
the motion and upon roll call the motion carried.

There being no further business the meeting was adjourned.
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At a regular meeting of the Board of Commissicners of the City of Pikeville,
Kentucky, held in the City Hall on April 2, 1965, at 7:30 P.M. E.S.T., The
following members were present.

Mayor i w, C. Hambley, M.D.

Ccmmisgsioners: Frederick W. Baker
Harry Hobson
Kermlt Sexton
Uhlan Taylor

Also present were City Manager W. E, Butcher, City Attorney 0. T. Hintoen,
Members of Board of Education and architect Jack T. Hatcher.

~ The Honorable W. C., Hambley, Mayor, presided and the minutes were recorded
by “harles Huffman, Jr. “ity Clerk.

WHEREAS, the Board of Education of the Fikeville City Schools and the Board
of Yommissioners of the “ity of Pikeville, Kentucky are in the process of cooper-
ating to 1ssue Schcol Building Revenue Bonds of the City of Pikeville, Kentucky,
pursuant to provisions of Sections 162-120 to 162.290 of the Kentucky Revised
Statutes, for the purpose of financing the construction of a new elementary schoojl
and improvements of existing bulldings, and

WHEREAS, plans and specifications for sald construction and improvements have
been prepared and filed in the office of the City Clerk and have been approved
by the State Superientendent of Fublic Instructicn and

WIEREAS, all of the requirements preliminary to the letting of the
construction contract have been complied with, including the approprlate slection
and approval of the architect, and appropriate legal advertising for sealed
proposals for furnishing all of the labor and materials required to construct
sald school building and lmprove existing buildings, and

NHEREAS, all bids received have been coneidﬁze§ and are as follows:
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Vest & Bartell 91 , 700, 0C $20,460.00 {13}#11E"ﬂ
Cincinnati, Ohic 13 ) 2,835 (14) no bid
(15 (16) no
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MINUTES } CITY OF PIKiEVILEEE

GENERAL CONSTRUCT1ON Base Bild Alternates
Goodman & Freston Contractors § 427,258.00 11. $21,500.00
Pikeville, Kentucky 12. 1,500.00

13. 3,200,008

1k, 500.00

15, 12,500.0

161 800.00
PLUMBING

John Perry Co., Inc. p 62,880.00 11. $ 5,040.00
Pikeville, Kentucky 12. No Bid

13. No Bid

14. No Bid

15. No Bid

164 5.260.00

MECHANICAL ) &
John Perry “o., Inc. 93,000.00 11. % 7,200.00
12. No Bia
13. No Bid
14, No “id
15. No Pid
16. No Bid
COMBINATION BID-PLUMBING & MECHANICAL
John Perry “o., Inc. $ 153,880.00 11. § 12,240.00
12,.No Bid
13. No bid
14, No Bid
15, Neo Pid
16 53260.00

ELECTRICAL h
Liberty Electric Co. ' 11. $§ 3,988.50
Lexington, Kentucky 12. No bid
13. bid
1k, 6,550.00
15. No Pid
16, =1d

Elliott Glass & Electric p  76,470.00

Pikeville, Kentucky 11, 4,090.00
12. No Bia
13. 85.00
14. 6,800.00
15. Bid
16. No Bid

KITCHEN EQUIFMENT .
Mastercraf$ Metals Co., Inc., $ 22,758.00 No Bid

PRE-FABRICATED REFRIGERATOR-FREEZER
Johnny Belcher, H.B.A.
Belcher Refrigeration & Electric
Service $ 6,585.00 No Bid

:
|
- |
FUENITURE AND EQUIPMENT Sec.l Sec., 2 Sec, 3 Sec., H sec 6 Tctg .

C & R 0ffice Supply Co. % 9,717.00
Pikeville, Kentucky $#4,020.00
$319.80 No B No Bid

Schocol Ser. Co., Inc. 10,038.00 4.1270.00
Frankfort, Kentucky 3,907.50 B.1%30.00
No Bid ' C. 151420

“outhern Desk Co. 9,044.50
Hickory, North Carolina 35155.50 )

Of fice Equipment Co. See See 53.72 A
Louisville, Ky. Peabody Peabody 2,718.33
'!I,"'..'ll*.n_ﬁr"'u
E,BEG’;C‘ﬁ
G. E. Maier Co, 75383.60° . |
Cineinnati, Ohio 34229.20 .
No Bid No 3,059.36
13'}?02-16
Peabody Q,187.8 ;
North Manchester, Ind. 3,195.60
No ©id No - A.1,436.00
Central School Supply Co. ot
Louisville, Ky. l:‘QII'DE,hLL_ﬁo
541 .73
2 ,400.40 .
3,828.40 :
22,389.51

are the lowest and best to the Board

nside

WHEREAE, the matter of which bild
and the City has been sufficiently co

-

. - it o fr crmm ey W] e -3 e i
o iy : :

oL -

* . :‘I : _ -- l.‘ : .#:‘- - 3 I
S ST AT A G o
o e FEan R
-.-.'?“__h_d.k % :
a8 “;E%Emﬁ A% i

| g L:E-E‘ ¥
R 5%;} = e b
e =, -
: R i :

-

SRR SERNISE Y

Al



Iy LhEl
RIS SR

R
o

¥ ..'q;-.’-d-. 5...;[‘|l '__:_.- .'l.i_l'i'-i-lj " - -_..___-. g | i

'
|
A
i
5
B

v
g
3.

1y B e T
1 L

&

e e e -
T i
v g g
R e e TR
- g s - ..

L i & -
v e e oy @ g A
1 o ! i

|
I
¥
b
£
|3
L]

=

el e
-

Now, Therefore, be it resolved and ordered by the Beard of “ommissioners
of the “ity of Pikef¥ille, Kentucky, as follows:

l. That the bid of :

(A. General Construction) Goodman and Preston “ontractors to construct
the new bullding in the Fikeville City School District in the base
amount of § 427,258.00, including the acceptance fo alternates # 13.
8aid base bid and alternates being at a total price of § 430,458.00.

(B. Combination Bid-Plumbing and Mechanical) |
John Perry Co., Inc, in the base amount of $ 153,880.00, including the
acceptance of alternates-None, said base bid, and alternates being at a

W 2

total price of % 1534800.00.

(D, Electrical)

Elliott Glass and Electric in the base amount of $76,470.00, including
the acceptance of alternates-None- said base bld and alternates beilng
at a total price of § 76,470.00.

(E. Kitchen Equipment) |
Mastercraft Metals Co.:, Inc. in the base amount of § 22,758.00, including
the acceptance of alternates-None- said base bid and alternates being |
at a total price of $22,758.00. |

(F. Pre-fabricated Refrigerator~Freezer)

Johnny Belcher, DBA Belcher Refrigeration and Electrlie Service in the |

base amount of $ 6,585.00 , including the acceptance of alternates-None-

said base bid and alternates being at a total price éf $6,585.00. ”
I

And the bids to provide furniture and equipment in the base amounts set
forth below be accepted and confirmed, and the Mayor and City Clerk are authorlzed
to execute the contract with said bidders at said prices in accordance with said F
bids;a true ccpy of which shall be recorded herewith in the 'minutes of thils I
meeting: I

I

| ihe bids are as follows:

Furniture:
A. The peabedy Seating Company, Inc. of North Manchester, Indiana-
Pupil desks and chairs, Section 1, item A-H 3 6,115.8&

B, Central Schecol Supply Co. Loulsville, Ky.
Pupil desks and chairs of Section 1, Items I to L. 4%,263.75

C. The Pe_body Seating Co., Inc. s Louisville, Ky.
Section 2, Teachers desks & Chairs, 1,491.28

D, Central School Supply Col , Louisville, Ky.
Section 2, Teachers decks & chairs 2,370.40

E. C. & R, 0ffice Supply “o., Pikeville, Kentucky
Section 3, Office desks & chairs 319.80

F. bSouthern Desk Co. , Hickory, N. C.
Section 5, classrcocm reading tables and chairs 2,188.00

G, School Service Co.,Inc. Frankrort,Ky.
Wection 6, Lunchroom tables, chalirs and trucks 3,014,20

H. Ilotal Furniture $§ 19,760.23

That the acceptance of this subjects the City teo no liabllity in the
event that the City for any reason shall be unable to issue School
Building fevenue Bonds to provide funds to pay the contract price.

|
That the successful bidders must furnish adequate bond satisfactory to th e
City for the faithful performance of his contract prior te April 12,
1969, cor suffer such contract to be cancelled and forfeltl the amount of
his bid bond equal to five per cent (5#) of the amount bid.

4, That all orders, resolutions, ordinances or motions in conflict herewith
are repealed to the extent of such conflict and that this resolution shalll
take effect and be in force at cnce.

The foregoing order and resolution was first read to the members of the
Board of Commissioners in its entirety, and after consideration the yea and nay
vote was on the motion to pass and adopt said order and resolution and resulted
ns follows:

Mayor : W, C. Hambley, M:D.
Commissioners: Federick W, “aker
Harry Hobson
Kermit ~exton
Uhlan Taylor
and adopt the order and resolution, the Mayor declared
was carried id that the order and resolution were properly passed
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MINUTES | CITY OF PIKEVILLE

The mihutes were then read by the City Clerk and no correction being fomnd
necessary, it was moved by Uhlan Taylor and seconded by Kermit Sexfton that they
be approved as read and ordered signed. lhe motion was carried with the fmllﬂwingi
v 1_-{-:-" ™

Mayor: W. Co Hymbley, M.D. Yes
Commissioners: Federick W. DBaker Yes
Harry Hobson Yes
Kermit Sexton Yes
Uhlan “ayler Yes

Thereupon, the Mayor and the “ity Clerk signed such minutes with the approval

of the members present when the Soard of “Yommissicners met. ;
Harry Hobson made the motion that The City Attorney, 0. *. Hinton be authoriged

to represent the City in any action by the Public Bervice Commission regarding

the United Fuel Gas Co. rate case. Kermit Sexton seconded the motion and upon

roll call the vote was as follows: ‘

Mayor: W. C. Hambley, M.D. Yes
Commissioners: Federick W. Baker Yes
Harry Hobson Yes
Kermit Sexten Yes
Uhlan 4aylor Yes

IThe Métion carried.

There being no further business to come pefore the Board it was moved by
| Kermit SBexton and seconded by Federick W. Baker and unanimcusly carried that

| the meeting adjourn.
AFPROVED | |
L , Ve
DC . LM&\ W

MAYOR

s

CITY CLERK

A ke e ke ok o ok ok e ok ok ok ok ke ok ok ok ok ok o ko

At a regular meeting of the PBoard of Commissioners of the City of Pikeville,
'Kentucky held in the statlite bowling center on April 9, 1965 at 7:30 P.M, the
|following members were present:

I Mavor: W. C. Hambley, M. D.
Comm : F. W. Baker
Kermit Sexton

The Mayor read the following resolution:
RESOLUTICN

BE IT RESOLVED: The “oard of Commissioners of the City of

Pikeville, Pike “Younty,Kentucky, hereby approves entering into an
agreement with Pikeville College, Pikeville, Pike County, Kentucky,
to participate in the off-campus Work-8tudy Program of the college.
The City will provide supervision, employee benefits as needed, and the
10 per cent non-federal salary contribution. It is hereby affirmed
that the employment of said Work-Study Personnel will involve services
that would not otherwise be provided, will not result in the displacement
of emglcyed workers, nor impair existing contracts for services,

. W. Baker, Commissicner, moved the adoption of the *lesolution,

Kermit Sexton seconded the motien. Upon roll call, the vote was as follows:

Mayor : W. C. Hambley, M. D, Yes
Commisslioners F. W Baker Yes
Kermit Sexton Yas

T
. .

he Mayor declared the Resolution adopted.

The Mayor read in its entirety an ordinance identified by 4ts title or caption

as follows: AN ORDINANCE ANNEXING TERRITORY ADJACENT TO THE PRESENT CITY LIMITS
ON FERGUSON CREEK

F. W, Baker moved the adoption of the foregoing Ordinance and Kermit Sexton
seccnded the motion. Upon roll call the vote was as follows:

Mayor W. C., Hambley Yes, F. W. Baker Yes,..Kermlit Sexton JXes.

Mayor Hambley declared the ordinance adopted. There bejng nq further busis
ness the meeting was adjourned. APPROVED 1 .~ | | ?\\E{:
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